BOARD OF SUPERVISORS AGENDA ITEM REPORT
Nlnzost/ CONTRACTS / AWARDS / GRANTS

¢ Award C Contract ( Grant Requested Board Meeting Date: 7/6/2021

* = Mandatory, information must be provided or Procurement Director Award [

*Contractor/Vendor Name/Grantor (DBA):
Phoenix Pumps, Inc (Headquarters: Phoenix, AZ)
E-Konomy Pool Service, Inc (Headquarters: Tucson, AZ)

*Project Title/Description:
Small Pumps and Pump Parts 15hp or less

*Purpose:
Award: Master Agreement No. MA-PO-21-200. This Master Agreement is for an initial term of one (1) year in the

shared annual award amount amount of $253,000.00 (including sales tax) and includes four (4) one-year renewal
options. Administering Department: Regional Wastewater Reclamation

*Procurement Method:
Pursuant to Pima County Procurement Code 11.12.010, Competitive sealed bidding, Solicitation No. IFB-PO-2100096

was conducted. Three (3) responses were received. Award is to the lowest, responsive and responsible bidders.

PRCUID: 411957

Attachments: Notice of Recommendation for Award and Master Agreements.

*Program Goals/Predicted Outcomes:
To obtain a contract source to provide industrial grade pumps 15hp or less and parts used in various applications on
County facilities, stadiums, parks and water treatment facilities.

*Public Benefit:
Continuous water service for public facilities and chemical treatment for wastewater reclamation processes.

*Metrics Available to Measure Performance:
Department will monitor on-time delivery and billing to ensure contract compliance.

*Retroactive:
No.
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Contract/ Awa nformatio

Document Type: MA Department Code: PO Contract Number (i.e.,15-123): 21-200
Commencement Date: 08/21/21 Termination Date: 08/20/22 Prior Contract Number (Synergen/CMS):
[XI Expense Amount: $* 253,000.00 (] Revenue Amount: $

*Funding Source(s) required; General Fund; WW Ops Fund

Funding from General Fund? (@'Yes ( No If Yes $ % 25

Contract is fully or partially funded with Federal Funds? [ Yes No
If Yes, is the Contract to a vendor or subrecipient?

Were insurance or indemnity clauses modified? ] Yes No

If Yes, attach Risk's approval.

Vendor is using a Social Security Number? [] Yes No

If Yes, attach the required form per Administrative Procedure 22-10.

Amendment/ Revised Award Information

Document Type: Department Code: Contract Number (i.e.,15-123):
Amendment No.: AMS Version No.;
Commencement Date: New Termination Date:

Prior Contract No. (Synergen/CMS}):
(" Expense or (" Revenue (" Increase (" Decrease  Amount This Amendment; $
Is there revenue included? (CYes (" No If Yes §

*Funding Source(s) required:

Funding from General Fund?  ("Yes ( No If Yes § %
Grant/Amendment Information (for grants acceptance and awards)  Award  ( Amendment
Document Type: Department Code: Grant Number (i.e.,15-123):
Commencement Date: Termination Date: Amendment Number:

(] Match Amount: $ [] Revenue Amount: $

*All Funding Source(s) required:

*Match funding from General Fund? (CYes (CNo IfYes$ %

*Match funding from other sources? (Yes CNo IfYes§$ %
*Funding Source:

*If Federal funds are received, is funding coming directly from the
Federal government or passed through other organization(s)?

Contact: Michael Warren, Procurement Officer Michael D. Warren g e’ 57 57 Ana Wilber Siie s arer
Department: Procurement Terri Spencer i i s Telephone: 724-3730

Department Director Signature/DateW\ d”fi'{/l] 7
Deputy County Administrator Signat{fe/Date: = ——— G/l (202 /
— V3 L3

County Administrator Signature/Date: 5//2;[— /2]
rd

(Required for Board Agenda/Addendum ltems) Y /
Revised 5/2020 Page 2 of 2
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PIMA COUNTY

PROCUREMENT

NOTICE OF RECOMMENDATION FOR AWARD

Date of Issue: 06/11/2021

The Procurement Department hereby issues formal notice to respondents to Solicitation No.
IFB-PO-2100096 for Small Pumps and Pump Parts 15hp or Less, that the following listed
respondent will be recommended for award as indicated below. The award action is scheduled
to be performed by the Board of Supervisors on or after July 6, 2021.

Award in the shared annual contract amount of $253,000.00 (including sales tax) is
recommended to the lowest, responsive and responsible Bidders.

AWARDEE NAME
Phoenix Pumps, Inc.
Group A
Group B
Group C
Group D
Group E
Group F
Group G
Group H
Group |
Group J
Group L
Group M
Group N
Group O
Lines 1, 2, 3, 4, 7 and 8 through 35
E-Konomy Pool Services and Supplies

e GroupK

e GroupN

e GroupO

Lines 5 and 6

OTHER RESPONDENT NAMES
DXP Enterprises, Inc.
e Groups A through E
e GroupF
e Groups G through N
e GroupO
Lines 1, 2, 3, 8, 12,13 and 29

BID AMOUNT

$ 6,092.60
$15,399.36
$17,818.05
$ 7,720.70
$11,874.80
$23,977.90*
$ 3,296.80
$10,150.69
$ 4,891.64
$10,463.66
$56,049.05
$16,914.98
NO BID

$38,610.48 ¢

$ 8,165.96
NO BID
$15,511.82 ¢

BID AMOUNT

NO BID
$27,106.00
NO BID
$ 3,633.00 2

Au/



* Bid Amount as shown includes corrections.
1 Bid Amount reflects total for all lines bid with award to lines with the lowest unit price.
2 Bid Amount reflects total for all lines bid with none being the lowest unit price.

Issued by: Michael Warren, Procurement Officer
Telephone Number: (520) 724-3730
This notice is in compliance with Pima County Procurement Code 811.12.010(C) and

§11.20.010(C).

Copy to: Pima County SBE via e-mail at SBE@pima.gov .

Page 2 of 2
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o, MASTER AGREEMENT

N AAAAAAAY
M_ PIMA COUNTY, ARIZONA
PIMA COUNTY THIS IS NOT AN ORDER - TRANSMISSION CONSTITUTES
CONTRACT EXECUTION
Master Agreement No: 21000000000000000200 MA Version: 2 Page: 1 of 11

Description: Small Pumps and Pump Parts 15hp or less

1 Pima County Procurement Department Initiation Date: 08-21-2021
T
S 150 W. Congress St. 5th Fl Expiration Date: 08-20-2022
E
S Tucson AZ 85701
R
U
Issued By: MICHAEL WARREN M NTE Amount:
E :
Phone: 5207243730 S Used Amount: $0.00
R Email: michael.warren@pima.gov
\"
E-Konomy Pool Service Inc Contact: Thomas DeHerrera
E
N 6020 E Speedway Blvd Phone: 520-325-6427
Email: commercial@e-konomy.com
D Tucson AZ 85712
Terms: 0.00 %
° Days: 30
R
Shipping Method: Vendor Method
Delivery Type: Standard Ground
FOB: FOB Dest, Freight Prepaid

Modification Reason

This Master Agreement is for an initial term of one (1) year in the shared annual award amount amount of $308,000.00 (including sales tax) and
includes four (4) one-year renewal options.

Attachment: Offer Agreement

This Master Agreement incorporates the attached documents, and by reference all instructions, Standard Terms and Conditions, Special
Terms and Conditions, and requirements that are included in or referenced by the soliciation documents used to establish this agreement. All
transactions and conduct are required to conform to these documents.



o MASTER AGREEMENT DETAILS

0
Master Agreement No: 21000000000000000200 MA Version: 2 Page: 2 of 11
Line Description
1 Pump, Cast Iron, 3hp, 208-230/460v, 1750rpm, Taco
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $4,365.99 27344 1641C3N2
2 Pump, Base Mnt, End Suction & Motor, 7.5hp, Taco
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $3,767.99 27344 F13009D
3 Casing Gasket, Taco
Discount UuomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $15.99 27344 1641C3N2
4 Pump, Frame Mnt, Self-Priming, Berkeley
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $3,039.38 27344 B69876
5 Pump, Centrifugal, 15hp, 3x2.5npt, Berkeley
Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $3,049.08 27344 B54576MS1



o, MASTER AGREEMENT

N AAAAAAAY
M_ PIMA COUNTY, ARIZONA
PIMA COUNTY THIS IS NOT AN ORDER - TRANSMISSION CONSTITUTES
CONTRACT EXECUTION
Master Agreement No: 21000000000000000200 MA Version: 2 Page: 3 of 11

Description: Small Pumps and Pump Parts 15hp or less

1 Pima County Procurement Department Initiation Date: 08-21-2021
T
S 150 W. Congress St. 5th Fl Expiration Date: 08-20-2022
E
S Tucson AZ 85701
R
U
c Issued By: MICHAEL WARREN M NTE Amount:
Phone: 5207243730 S Used Amount: $0.00
R Email: michael.warren@pima.gov
\"
PHOENIX PUMPS INC Contact: BRANDON VISE
E
5100 S 36th St Phone: 602-232-2994
N .
Email: sales@phoenixpumps.com
D Phoenix AZ 85040
Terms: 0.00 %
° Days: 30
R
Shipping Method: Vendor Method
Delivery Type: Standard Ground
FOB: FOB Dest, Freight Prepaid

Modification Reason

This Master Agreement is for an initial term of one (1) year in the shared annual award amount amount of $308,000.00 (including sales tax) and
includes four (4) one-year renewal options.

Attachment: Offer Agreement

This Master Agreement incorporates the attached documents, and by reference all instructions, Standard Terms and Conditions, Special
Terms and Conditions, and requirements that are included in or referenced by the soliciation documents used to establish this agreement. All
transactions and conduct are required to conform to these documents.
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MASTER AGREEMENT DETAILS

Master Agreement No: 21000000000000000200 MA Version: 2 Page: 4 of 11
Line Description
1 Pump, Vertical I/L, 3" 1/0, 3HP, 3PH, 460V, 145JM
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $2,906.14 27344 4360-3D-2P
2 Pump, Centrifugal, 2'x1-1/2"
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $1,692.1575 27344 4270
3 Lantern Ring
Discount uUoM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $66.42 27344 0118035-000
4 Packing Kit
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $9.60 27344 969000-028
5 Packing Gland
Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $591.30 27344 D251905-41
6 Casing Gasket
Discount UuomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $38.85 27344 D251926-001
7 Inboard Bearing
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $52.65 27344 971101-925
8 Outboard Bearing
Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $77.76 27344 971101-926
9 Pump, Centrifugal, 15hp
Discount uUomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $4,265.00 33887 E-1510-5BD-15HP-K
10 Pump, Centrifugal, 10hp
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $3,098.75 27344 E-1510-3BD
1 Pump, Centrifugal Base Mnt, 1/2hp, 3ph, 230/460v
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $1,878.75 27344 E-1510-1.25
12 Pump, Centrifugal Inline, 2hp, 3/60/230-460V
Discount uomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $3,056.25 27344 E-80SC
13 Seal Bearing Assembly
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $551.175 27344 185332LF
14 Bearing Assembly 2
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $320.35 27344 189165
15 Mechanical Seal Kit
Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $216.70 33978 186862
16 Sleeve Kit, SS
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $160.175 33979 185141
17 Casing Gasket
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $5.60 27344 P57700
18 Seal Kit, #8 BUNA
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $386.30 27344 186543
19 Shaft Sleeve, SS
Discount UoM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $301.50 27344 185022
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MASTER AGREEMENT DETAILS

Master Agreement No: 21000000000000000200 MA Version: 2 Page: 5 of 11
Line Description
20 Shaft Sleeve,
Discount Uuom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $183.725 27344 185025
21 Gasket
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $28.68 27344 P80767
22 Water Slinger
Discount uUoM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $10.02 33976 BGP53550
23 Gasket
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $27.88 33977 BGP48690
24 Ball Bearing Coupler End
Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $81.975 33980 BG186001
25 Ball Bearing Pump End
Discount UuomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $193.15 33981 BG186002
26 Pump, Submersible, 7.5hp, 3/60/230v, Cast Iron
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $6,988.275 27344 127651
27 Pump, Submersible, 1/4hp, 115v, SS
Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $576.30 10360 2JGA4
28 Pump, Submersible, 1/2hp, 115v, SS
Discount uUomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $512.7875 27344 3YU75A
29 Pump, Submersible, 1/4hp, 120v, SS
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $255.3625 27344 11C685
30 Pump, Submersible, 1/2hp, 3ph, 0.6kW, 6.64EPD
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $692.90 27344 40P707U664
31 Pump, Submersible, 1/3hp, Optima 3AS1 VBV
Discount uomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $258.70 27344 5S07-18
32 Pump, Submersible, 1/3hp, EPD
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $375.70 21187 EPD-3MS1
33 Pump, Submersible, 1hp, 1ph, 115v
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $904.80 18901 50DWXU6.75S
34 Pump, Submersible w/float switch, 1hp, 1ph, 115v
Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $878.80 33316 50DWXAU6.75S
35 Pump, Submersible w/float switch, 1hp, 1ph, 115v
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $878.80 33332 50DWAUB.75S
36 Pump, Centrifugal, Self-Priming, 4x4, T4B
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $5,204.55 27344 T4B60S-B/F
37 Pump, Centrifugal, Self-Priming, 3x3, T3A-B
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $3,821.60 27344 T3A60S-B
38 Pump, Submersible, 1hp
Discount UoM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $1,082.90 27344 SE2K3-E3



o MASTER AGREEMENT DETAILS

0

Master Agreement No: 21000000000000000200 MA Version: 2 Page: 6 of 11
Line Description
39 Pump, Peristaltic Turbidity

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $197.379 21135 30600-006S
40 Seal Assembly

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $362.583 27344 12461
41 Repair Kit

Discount uUoM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $61.854 21160 02501-067
42 Tubing Kit

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $27.846 21161 02500-882
43 Pump Kit

Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $33.189 21162 02501-068
44 Pump, Vertical, 10hp, 6-stage, EVS, 2/60/3

Discount UuomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $2,787.225 27344 15SV6FJ4F60
45 Pump, Aquavar IPC Advanced, 10hp, 2/460v 14.5a

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $1,563.975 27344 AVA40100A0F0X0X1
46 Pump, Centrifugal, 3hp, 2x2.5", ODPE, 8.25" imp

Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $1,671.85 27344 8SH3H11A0
47 Pump, Submersible, 2hp, 3/60/460v

Discount uUomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $2,477.80 27344 WS2034D4
48 Pump, Submersible, 2hp, 1/60/230v, 20ft cord

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $2,498.075 27344 WS2012D3
49 Pump, Submersible, 1.5hp, 3/60/460v

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $2,385.7625 33057 WS1534D4
50 Pump, Submersible, 1/2hp, 3/60/460V

Discount uomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $569.40 27344 1DW51C4EA
51 Pump, Submersible, 3/4hp, 3/60/460V

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $661.9625 27344 1DW51D4EA
52 Pump, Submersible, 1hp, 3/60/460V

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $707.20 27344 1DW51E4EA
53 Pump, Jet, w/Motor, 1hp, 115/230v

Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $666.25 27344 J10S
54 Pump, Centrifugal, 3BBFFRMAOK

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $1,425.375 27344 3656S
55 Controller, Aquavar Intelligent, N3R 7.5hp, 24a

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $2,753.625 27344 AVB10075C0X0X0X1
56 Controller, Hydrovar Variable Speed, 5hp, 3ph 460v

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $1,541.40 27344 10073LFAAUST
57 Pressure Tank, Water Stand

Discount UoM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $1,134.00 27344 WT-V350



o MASTER AGREEMENT DETAILS

0

Master Agreement No: 21000000000000000200 MA Version: 2 Page: 7 of 11
Line Description
58 Pump, Submersible, 2hp, Sewage Grinder, SS

Discount Uuom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $1,315.60 27344 HPGR200M2-2
59 Pump, Submersible, 3hp, 3ph 460v 50' cord

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $1,445.60 33525 S3WRD300M4.2
60 Impeller, 5.25 diameter for HPGHX300DD

Discount uUoM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $452.40 27344 07893-329-3
61 Seal, Mechanical, Hydrocarbon/Ceramic

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $83.20 12452 8073-000-1
62 Pump, Metering, 2.0gph, 115v 50/60Hz

Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $1,204.125 27344 AD861-A48HI
63 Pump, Metering, 8.0gph, 115v 50/60Hz

Discount UuomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $1,535.625 15868 C731-318Sl
64 Pump, Metering, 1.0gph, 110v

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $931.9375 27344 AD251-634VI
65 Pump, Degassing, 2.3gph, 115v

Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $1,522.625 27344 L-C111-D68HI
66 Spare Parts Kit

Discount uUomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $163.00 27344 SP85HV
67 Spare Parts Kit

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $143.00 27344 RPM-634
68 Repair Kit

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $194.00 27344 RPM-A40A
69 Pump, Peristaltic 26-100psi, Adjustable

Discount uomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $556.153 27344 45MJH1A1ST
70 Pump, Peristaltic 26-100psi

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $556.153 27344 45MJH2A1S
71 Pump, Peristaltic 26-100psi

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $556.153 27344 45MJH7A1S
72 Pump, Peristaltic 26-100psi

Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $413.40 27344 45MHP2
73 Pump, Peristaltic 100psi, Adjustable

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $436.80 27344 45MHP10
74 Pump, Peristaltic 100psi, Adjustable

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $413.40 27344 85MHP40
75 Pump, Peristaltic w/Motor, 40gpd

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $597.675 27344 85MJH7A1ST
76 Pump Head Assy w/Ferrules and Duck Bills

Discount UoM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $104.039 27344 QP107-1



o MASTER AGREEMENT DETAILS
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Master Agreement No: 21000000000000000200 MA Version: 2 Page: 8 of 11
Line Description
77 Pump, Submersible, 10hp, 4in

Discount Uuom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $5,605.60 33441 XFP100E
78 Pump, Submersible, 4.7hp, 4in

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $3,816.40 33541 XFP100CVX
79 Pump, Submersible, 1/2hp, 115v

Discount uUoM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $520.828 27344 EFO5W-2A
83 Pump, Peristaltic, Dura15, 1hp w/PVDF inserts

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $5,292.30 33467 D15NRPLS02025LM
84 Pump, Peristaltic, Dura35, 2hp, w/PP inserts

Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $9,731.475 33480 D35HRPLS04050LM
85 Pump, Peristaltic, VF65, 10hp

Discount UuomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $23,378.10 27344 VF65
86 Motor,Gear,1hp,Dura15

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $1,469.325 33468 IDNM3548T
87 Gearbox,Motovario,Dura15

Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $543.075 33469 NMRV050B25U25
88 Window,Inspect,FrontCover,Dura15

Discount uUomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $76.05 33470 139.2222.P
89 Gasket,FrontWindowCover,Dura15

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $3.90 33471 139.2235
90 Cover,FrontWindow,Dura15

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $54.275 33472 139.0140.S
91 O-Ring,FrontCover,Dura15

Discount uomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $25.35 33473 139.0076
92 Flange,Split,Dura15

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $285.675 33474 139.1335.B
93 Insert,SplitFlange,PVDF,Dura15

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $361.725 33475 139.2133
94 Kit,HoseBurstDetection,Dura15

Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $564.525 33477 129.0719
95 Hose,Natural RubberWhite,Dura15

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $278.85 33478 139.0002.3
96 Motor,Gear,2hp,Dura35

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $1,696.50 33481 IDNM3584T
97 Gearbox,Motovario,Dura35

Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $860.925 33482 NMRVP090B35U5
98 Window,Inspect,FrontCover,Dura35

Discount UoM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN

0.0000 % EA $184.275 33483 139.2224 P



o MASTER AGREEMENT DETAILS
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Master Agreement No: 21000000000000000200 MA Version: 2 Page: 9 of 11
Line Description
99 Gasket,Front Window Cover,Dura35
Discount Uuom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $8.775 33484 139.2233
100 Cover,FrontWindow,Dura35
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $204.75 33485 139.0142
101 O-Ring,FrontCover,Dura35
Discount uUoM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $42.90 33486 139.0078
102 Flange,Split,Dura35
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $862.875 33487 139.1337.B
103 Insert,SplitFlange,PP,Dura35
Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $285.675 33488 139.2182
104 Hose,Natural RubberWhite,Dura35
Discount UuomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $527.475 33489 139.0004.3
105 O-Ring,FrontCover,VF65
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $180.375 33514 129.0081
106 0O-Ring,InspectionCover, VF65
Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $16.575 33515 129.1243
107 RotorShimPack,VF65
Discount uUomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $2,085.525 33516 129.1360.A
108 PortFlangeAssy,VF65
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $2,095.275 33518 129.0890.U
109 Insert,PortFlange,VF65
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $1,437.15 33519 129.1414.S
110 SealKit,Flange,VF65
Discount uomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $496.275 33520 129.1037
111 Gasket,Drive,VF65
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $17.55 33521 129.0485
112 Sensor,Revolution, VF65
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $379.275 33522 129.0805
113 Kit,HoseBurstDetection,VF65
Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $565.50 33523 129.0720
114 Hose,Natural RubberWhite,VF65
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $1,566.825 33524 129.0007
115 Hose,Hypalon Green,Dura 5
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $469.95 33563 132.2081
116 Pump, Direct Drive, 3", Stainless Steel
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $11,379.60 33056 AL4197-IRV 1/60
117 Gear Reducer, AL4197
Discount UoM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $1,223.80 33061 3-551-005-627
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118 Gear Reducer Bracket, AL4197
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $126.875 33060 2-074-007-100-00
119 Rebuild Kit for AL4197
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $4,184.70 27344 3-464-REBUILD-K29
120 Pump, OTS, Engine Dr, 5hp
Discount uUoM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $457.60 27344 382A-99
121 Pump, Centrifugal, Self-Priming, 2x2, 3hp
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $609.70 33153 2766-95
122 Pump, Centrifugal, Self-Priming, 2x2, 3hp
Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $640.90 33418 276C-96
123 Pump w/Motor, 30hp, 3x3npt, 99.25" impeller
Discount UuomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $5,216.875 27344 B2EPBLS
126 Mechanical Seal
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $65.00 27344 S32014
127 Pump, Submersible, 1/4hp, 115v, 2a, 60Hz
Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $241.80 27344 R100-115 210358
128 Pump, Submersible, 4hp, 3kW
Discount uUomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $4,470.921 27344 SLV.40.A40.40,EX.
4.61RC
129 Pump, Jet, 1hp, SS, 1ph, 115/230v
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $566.748 27344 JP10S-SS
130 Pump, Submersible, 1/2hp, 115v
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $79.534 27344 500203
131 Pump, Submersible, 1hp, 115v
Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $690.313 27344 620241
132 Pump, Submersible, 1 1/2hp
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $221.00 27344 SX50H-01-50
133 JointSeal,NBR
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $65.00 27344 874470
134 O-Ring
Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $9.10 27344 516977
135 Seal,Flat
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $109.20 27344 590658
136 JointSeal,Flouro
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $84.50 27344 874469
137 GearJoint
Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $617.50 27344 687272
138 GearJoint
Discount UoM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $2,080.00 27344 198841L
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139 Rotor,HCP
Discount Uuom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $1,163.50 27344 4960459
140 Rotor,2525, 10HP
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $1,987.70 27344 BDNEGOA
141 Stator,NBR
Discount uUoM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $336.70 27344 4954300W
142 Stator 2205, 10HP
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $414.70 27344 NEGO1A
143 Pump, Centrifugal, 7.5hp, Cl Couple, 1/60/230v
Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $2,150.044 27344 10-30955130001-2712
144 Pump, Centrifugal, 5hp, 3/60/208-230/460v
Discount UuomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $1,275.157 27344 10-15507-130001-2681
145 Mechanical Seal
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $45.50 12598 22197WILL
146 Mechanical Seal, BSE2
Discount uUom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $166.40 27344 H87A28/B
147 Pump, 1hp, Whisperflo EE 115/208v
Discount uUomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $716.079 27344 WFE-4 PEN011513
148 Pump, 2hp, Superflo 230v, TEFC, Unionized Fittings
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $669.903 27344 11057
149 Pump, 3hp, Intelliflo VS SVRS 230v
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $1,687.361 27344 340040
150 Pump w/Motor, Cast Iron, 3hp, 3600rpm,
Discount uomM Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $3,061.50 27344 3194K192 MODEL 27
151 Mechanical Seal
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $58.50 27344 H87A28/B
152 Mechanical Seal, 6-WSP
Discount uom Unit Price Stock Code VPN MPN
0.0000 % EA $368.784 27344 H87A28/B



